From: Moira Deeming <Moira.Deeming@parliament.vic.gov.au>
Sent: Saturday, March 11, 2023 3:47 PM

To: Claire Wells >

Subject: RE: Let Women Speak - Melbourne

Hi Claire,
Sorry | just saw this. | had a funeral on Thursday and was in parliament and must have missed it in the fuss.

Just to be clear, what did you need on the security quote? As | said, I'll pay for sound.

Yes Monjon have the correct licenses, | checked &

Oh and I've just seen that you’d like us pay locally and be reimbursed, yes I’'m happy to take care of that too.
My private phone number is_that’s the fastest and surest way to reach me for urgent matters,
Kind Regards,

Moira Deeming MP

State Member for the Western Metropolitan Region

Parliamentary Whip for the Legislative Council

Suite 1 & 2, Level 2, 13-15 Lake Street, Caroline Springs VIC 3023

Phone (03) 8363 0288
Email moira.deeming@parliament.vic.gov.au

Moira
DEEMING

This message and its attachments may contain legally privileged or confidential information. It is intended solely for the named
addressee. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message or responsible for delivery of the message to the addressee,
you may not copy or deliver this message or its attachments to anyone. Rather, you should permanently delete this message
and its attachments and kindly notify the sender by reply e-mail.

From: Claire Wells _>

Sent: Saturday, 11 March 2023 4:00 AM

To: Moira Deeming <Moira.Deeming@parliament.vic.gov.au>
Subject: Let Women Speak - Melbourne

Dear Moira,

I’'m just finalising arrangements for the events and | would love to ask you for some help if possible please.
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Security:
I’'m really sorry that your original quotes for security didn’t reach me at first — they went to an email address to
which | don’t have access and KJK has recently sent them on, so I’'m a bit behind with this.

e Re the invoice from Monjon — I’'m assuming that they don’t offer a four hour option? Not sure if it’s worth
asking.

e Isit possible to confirm and pay for security now please? Kellie-Jay’s preferred method is if someone local
could pay the invoice and she could re-imburse using Paypal. Would that be possible?

e Also, we had a situation this morning in another location where the security that had been booked didn’t
have the correct licences. I'm sure given your status as an MP, the company you have suggested will have
the appropriate licence but | thought | should mention it!

Audio:
e The original quote from Red Pulse was a lot higher than the other locations. | now understand that you
expect the event itself to be significantly bigger than other events, which explains the issue! Again, is it
possible to book and pay for this, as above?

Thank you so much for all your research and help with this. If there’s anything you would like me to take care of,
please let me know.

With kind regards,

Claire Webb
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