From: Katrina Constable <KatrinaC@eqwe.com.au>

Sent: Tuesday, 29 June 2021 4:39 PM

To: Luke Price

Subject: FW: Veolia payment schedules

Attachments: Veolia AUS 28April21 Payment Schedule - Digestors (2).pdf

The first attachment is the 2™ Soc Gen deal we did — it came with the re-write which is the 2" attachment

KATRINA CONSTABLE

P +61 299 664 077 | M +61 409 925 702 | KatrinaC@eqgwe.com.au | Suite 906, Level 9, 6A Glen Street, Milsons Point NSW 2061 |
www.egwe.com.au

From: Eloise Orlandini

Sent: Friday, 30 April 2021 10:47 AM
To: Katrina Constable

Cc: Luke Price ; Bill Papas

Subject: Veolia payment schedules

Hi Katrina,

Attached are the two Veolia deals, one for equipment and one for the payout rewrite. We have sent off the
annexure for payout rewrite this morning expected back Monday.

Let me know if we need to do anything else.
Kind regards,

Eloise Orlandini
Executive Assistant to CEO

T +2 9002 4038
A Level 5, 141 Walker Street, North Sydney NSW 2060
E eorlandini@iugis.com
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